
 

 

Dear Potential Sponsor: 

 

ThunderRidge High School’s baseball program would like to thank you for your continued support of 
our program, including sponsorship advertising on our outfield fence and concession stand. 
Because of your assistance, our program continues to grow and serve ThunderRidge High School 
and our student/athletes. 

Joe White field, named for our former Hall of Fame Head Coach, is one of the premier high school 
facilities in Colorado. Boasting 2 indoor training buildings, a 6-man turf bullpen and pitcher training 
area, as well as a beautiful natural grass field and diamond, ThunderRidge is host to hundreds of 
games and tournaments throughout the spring, summer and fall seasons. 

Our facility and program needs continue to evolve and grow. In addition to regular yearly needs and 
maintenance such as uniforms and equipment, our future plans include adding an outdoor locker 
room for our players, improvements to our outdoor batting cages, as well as upgrading our auxiliary 
turf infield area. Your sponsorship is a key component of our fundraising efforts and very much 
appreciated! 

Pricing for banners is $500 for a new banner and $300 to renew every year. Additionally, we offer 
plaques that are hung from our press box/concession stand that are $350 new and $250 to renew. A 
banner and plaque combo is $700 for both and $500 to renew both yearly. 

Additionally, our advertising coordinators will include regular social media shoutouts to all of our 
sponsors through our Facebook, Instagram and X (Twitter) accounts!! 

If you are interested in supporting ThunderRidge High School Baseball, please complete the 
attached Lease Agreement, make your check payable to GBBC, and make note of ThunderRidge 
Baseball on your check. You can submit forms directly to our coordinators or mail your information 
to our coordinators at the address on the Lease Agreement. 

Thank you for your time and continued support of ThunderRidge High School Baseball!! 

 

E.J. Mapps 
Head Baseball Coach, ThunderRidge High School 



ThunderRidge High School Baseball 

Outfield Fence or Concession Stand Sponsorship Advertising Lease 

 

 

Business Name:__________________________________________________________________ 

Date of Agreement:_______________________________________________________________ 

Contact Person:__________________________________________________________________ 

Address:_________________________________________________________________________ 

City, State and Zip Code:__________________________________________________________ 

Business Telephone #:____________________________________________________________ 

Email Address:___________________________________________________________________ 

Signature of Leaser:______________________________________________________________ 

 

 

Please include this FORM and CHECK made out to GBBC to: 

Dave Carpinello, ThunderRidge Baseball Sponsor Coordinator 
1901 W. Littleton Blvd., Suite 218 
Littleton, CO 80120 

 

Lease Terms: ThunderRidge Baseball will provide a banner or sign based on Leaser’s choice to be 
affixed to either the outfield fence or concession stand or both. Banners are 5’x6” and plaques are 
3’x3’. It is the obligation of the individual or business to provide the design and artwork including 
wording and graphics in a timely manner to allow for sign production. The leaser understands that 
this is a one time commitment and is not obligated to make any further payments beyond the 
original lease agreement. All banners and signs will be approved and in accordance with 
ThunderRidge High School administration and the Douglas County School District. 

 

Artwork Instructions: The visual clarity of your banner or sign is best by avoiding smaller text or 
small detailed graphics. Larger and simple graphics are more visible from seating areas. Please use 
one of the following formats for your artwork: PDF, TIF or JPG. Artwork can be emailed to 

Dave Carpinello at carpi1@msn.com or Coach E.J. Mapps at emapps@dcsdk12.org 


